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The Month Gawne By April 2018 
 

What Happened? 
 

The TSX had its first positive month of the year. The 
U.S. 10-year government bond yield hit 3%. The Bank of 
Canada has indicated that they will be raising rates soon 
and some Canadian banks have raised their fixed 
mortgage rates.  
 

International trade continues to be at the forefront with 
negotiations underway between the US and the rest of 
the world. History was made when Kim Jong Un crossed 
into South Korea for a meeting with Moon Jae-in. Kim 
has suspended nuclear testing and appears ready to talk 
about denuclearization. But peace might not be Kim's 
only motivation. A mountain collapsed at North Korea's 
nuclear test site, which has triggered earthquakes and 
may be leaching radioactivity into China.   
 

Mark Zuckerberg testified before Congress on privacy, 
data mining, regulations, and Cambridge Analytica. 
 

Markets (as of April 30th, 2018) 
 

Stocks Benchmark April YTD 

Canada S&P TSX Composite 1.57% -3.71% 

United 
States 

S&P 500 0.27% -0.96% 

International MSCI EAFE 1.89% -0.35% 

Emerging 
Markets 

MSCI Emerging 
Markets 

-0.55% 0.93% 

World MSCI ACWI 0.52% -1.48% 

 

Bonds Benchmark April YTD 

Canada 
FTSE TMX Canada 

Universe Bond 
-0.86% -0.76% 

United 
States 

Bloomberg Barclays 
US Aggregate 

-0.74% -2.19% 

World 
Bloomberg Barclays 

Global Aggregate 
-1.60% -0.26% 

 

Currency April YTD 

CAD / USD (Source: ThomsonOne) -0.78% 1.59% 

 

Articles of Interest 
 

Suspect caught at music concert in China with facial 
recognition technology 
 

China's social credit system – Eerily similar to the Black 
Mirror episode 
 

A sudden loss of wealth may be hazardous to your 
health 
 

25 Facts for National Beer Day – watering down beer in 
Babylon was punishable by death 
 

Music 
 

Spotify – My only complaint is that there is not enough 
time in the day to listen to all the great music  
 

How to earn $1 million from Spotify with no musical 
talent 
 

Savant-like piano skills obtained through a head injury 
 

The Leafs 
 

At least the series with Boston was entertaining. The 
Bruins deserved to win based on what I saw. But I can't 
help but feel disappointed with the outcome. Playoffs are 
very different from the regular season, there were some 
players who impressed and others that left a lot to be 
desired. There's always next year. I was happy to see 
Lamoriello not return as GM.     

 
Food 
 

For cheese lovers  
 

The Last Conversation You'll Ever Need to Have About 
Eating Right – written in a conversational style, asking 
and answering common questions regarding diet and 
health  
 

Frozen pizza – has been a staple of my diet for quite 
some time 
 

Tomato-less salsa 
 
 
 
 

https://www.marketwatch.com/story/heres-what-it-means-for-the-market-that-the-us-10-year-yields-3-2018-04-24
http://business.financialpost.com/news/economy/bank-of-canadas-latest-indicator-cliches-it-interest-rates-are-going-up-soon
https://www.theglobeandmail.com/investing/personal-finance/article-rbc-hikes-mortgage-rates-joining-td/
https://www.washingtonpost.com/news/powerpost/paloma/the-finance-202/2018/04/30/the-finance-202-trump-team-s-trade-diplomacy-faces-critical-tests-in-europe-and-asia/5ae6713930fb043711926910/?utm_term=.8f558cf8b902
https://www.thestar.com/news/world/2018/04/26/north-korean-leader-kim-jong-un-walks-south-to-meet-moon-jae-in-is-a-nuke-deal-possible.html
https://www.thestar.com/news/world/2018/04/26/north-korean-leader-kim-jong-un-walks-south-to-meet-moon-jae-in-is-a-nuke-deal-possible.html
http://www.iflscience.com/policy/this-could-be-the-real-reason-north-korea-halted-nuclear-testing-and-its-terrifying/
https://www.theatlantic.com/technology/archive/2018/04/the-strangest-moments-from-the-zuckerberg-testimony/557672/
https://cambridgeanalytica.org/
https://ca.spindices.com/indices/equity/sp-tsx-composite-index
https://ca.spindices.com/indices/equity/sp-tsx-composite-index
https://ca.spindices.com/indices/equity/sp-500
https://www.msci.com/eafe
https://www.msci.com/emerging-markets
https://www.msci.com/emerging-markets
https://www.msci.com/acwi
http://www.ftse.com/products/FTSETMX/Home/Indices
http://www.ftse.com/products/FTSETMX/Home/Indices
https://www.bloombergindices.com/bloomberg-barclays-indices/
https://www.bloombergindices.com/bloomberg-barclays-indices/
https://www.bloombergindices.com/bloomberg-barclays-indices/
https://www.bloombergindices.com/bloomberg-barclays-indices/
https://www.theverge.com/2018/4/12/17229530/china-facial-recognition-technology-suspect-music-festival
https://www.theverge.com/2018/4/12/17229530/china-facial-recognition-technology-suspect-music-festival
https://www.fastcompany.com/40563225/chinas-terrifying-social-credit-surveillance-system-is-expanding
https://www.imdb.com/title/tt2085059/
https://www.imdb.com/title/tt2085059/
http://www.latimes.com/science/sciencenow/la-sci-sn-suddenly-poor-death-20180403-story.html
http://www.latimes.com/science/sciencenow/la-sci-sn-suddenly-poor-death-20180403-story.html
http://mentalfloss.com/article/52941/25-amazing-facts-national-beer-day
https://qz.com/email/quartz-obsession/1243667/
https://qz.com/1212330/a-bulgarian-scheme-scammed-spotify-for-1-million-without-breaking-a-single-law/
https://qz.com/1212330/a-bulgarian-scheme-scammed-spotify-for-1-million-without-breaking-a-single-law/
https://youtu.be/GTHDuZo7G3Y
https://youtu.be/GTHDuZo7G3Y
https://www.atlasobscura.com/foods/casu-marzu-italy?utm_source=Atlas+Obscura+Daily+Newsletter&utm_campaign=6fcbd98190-EMAIL_CAMPAIGN_2018_04_03&utm_medium=email&utm_term=0_f36db9c480-6fcbd98190-63348637&ct=t(EMAIL_CAMPAIGN_4_3_2018)&mc_cid=6fcbd98190&mc_eid=94a16b55ff
http://www.grubstreet.com/2018/03/ultimate-conversation-on-healthy-eating-and-nutrition.html
http://www.grubstreet.com/2018/03/ultimate-conversation-on-healthy-eating-and-nutrition.html
https://tedium.co/2018/04/17/frozen-pizza-history/?utm_source=Tedium&utm_campaign=Tedium_04_17_2018&utm_medium=email
http://www.geniuskitchen.com/recipe/fresh-pepper-salsa-373216
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Disclaimers 
 
The information contained herein has been provided by The Gawne Group and is for information purposes only. The information has been drawn from 

sources believed to be reliable. Graphs and charts are used for illustrative purposes only and do not reflect future values or future performance of any 

investment. The information does not provide financial, legal, tax or investment advice. Particular investment, tax, or trading strategies should be 

evaluated relative to each individual's objectives and risk tolerance. 

Index returns are shown for comparative purposes only. Indexes are unmanaged and their returns do not include any sales charges or fees as such 

costs would lower performance. It is not possible to invest directly in an index. 

FTSE TMX Global Debt Capital Markets Inc. [Year] "FTSE®" is a trade mark of FTSE International Ltd and is used under license. "TMX” is a trade mark 

of TSX Inc. and is used under licence. All rights in the FTSE TMX Global Debt Capital Markets Inc.'s indices and/or FTSE TMX Global Debt Capital 

Markets Inc.'s ratings vest in FTSE TMX Global Debt Capital Markets Inc. and/or its licensors. Neither FTSE TMX Global Debt Capital Markets Inc. nor 

its licensors accept any liability for any errors or omissions in such indices and/or ratings or underlying data. No further distribution of FTSE TMX Global 

Debt Capital Markets Inc.'s data is permitted without FTSE TMX Global Debt Capital Markets Inc.'s express written consent. 

The Gawne Group is part of TD Wealth Private Investment Advice, a division of TD Waterhouse Canada Inc. which is a subsidiary of The Toronto-
Dominion Bank. 
 
All trademarks are the property of their respective owners. 
 
® The TD logo and other trade-marks are the property of The Toronto-Dominion Bank. 

 


